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1 What planet is the nearest to the Sun?
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visited by mankind in this century?

AA Mercury

BB Venus

CC Moon

DD Mars

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



8 Which of the following places have been
visited by mankind in this century?

AA Mercury

BB Venus

CC Moon

DD Mars

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



8 Which of the following places have been
visited by mankind in this century?

AA Mercury

BB Venus

CC Moon

DD Mars

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



8 Which of the following places have been
visited by mankind in this century?

AA Mercury

BB Venus

CC Moon

DD Mars

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



8 Which of the following places have been
visited by mankind in this century?

AA Mercury

BB Venus

CC Moon

DD Mars

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



9 Which of following is the proper name for
the Sun and the 8 planets that orbit around
it?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD The Galaxy

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



9 Which of following is the proper name for
the Sun and the 8 planets that orbit around
it?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD The Galaxy

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



9 Which of following is the proper name for
the Sun and the 8 planets that orbit around
it?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD The Galaxy

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



9 Which of following is the proper name for
the Sun and the 8 planets that orbit around
it?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD The Galaxy

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



9 Which of following is the proper name for
the Sun and the 8 planets that orbit around
it?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD The Galaxy

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



10 What is the biggest from the list below?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD A Planet

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



10 What is the biggest from the list below?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD A Planet

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



10 What is the biggest from the list below?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD A Planet

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



10 What is the biggest from the list below?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD A Planet

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



10 What is the biggest from the list below?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD A Planet

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds





1 What planet is the nearest to the Sun?

AA Venus

BB Mars

CC Mercury

DD Saturn

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



1 What planet is the nearest to the Sun?

AA Venus

BB Mars

CC Mercury

DD Saturn

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



2 How many moons does the planet Mars
have?

AA 0

BB 1

CC 2

DD 3

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



2 How many moons does the planet Mars
have?

AA 0

BB 1

CC 2

DD 3

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



3 What shape is the Earth?

AA Disc

BB Sphere

CC Cube

DD Pyramid

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



3 What shape is the Earth?

AA Disc

BB Sphere

CC Cube

DD Pyramid

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



4 What planet is the hottest in the Solar
System?

AA Mercury

BB Venus

CC Earth

DD Mars

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



4 What planet is the hottest in the Solar
System?

AA Mercury

BB Venus

CC Earth

DD Mars

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



5 Which planet in the Solar System has the
largest number of moons?

AA Venus

BB Jupiter

CC Saturn

DD Uranus

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



5 Which planet in the Solar System has the
largest number of moons?

AA Venus

BB Jupiter

CC Saturn

DD Uranus

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



6 Which planet is the largest in the Solar
System?

AA Jupiter

BB Saturn

CC Uranus

DD Neptune

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



6 Which planet is the largest in the Solar
System?

AA Jupiter

BB Saturn

CC Uranus

DD Neptune

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



7 Which ‘planet’ has an orbit that is not the
same as all other planets?

AA Mercury

BB Saturn

CC Earth

DD Pluto

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



7 Which ‘planet’ has an orbit that is not the
same as all other planets?

AA Mercury

BB Saturn

CC Earth

DD Pluto

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



8 Which of the following places have been
visited by mankind in this century?

AA Mercury

BB Venus

CC Moon

DD Mars

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



8 Which of the following places have been
visited by mankind in this century?

AA Mercury

BB Venus

CC Moon

DD Mars

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



9 Which of following is the proper name for
the Sun and the 8 planets that orbit around
it?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD The Galaxy

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



9 Which of following is the proper name for
the Sun and the 8 planets that orbit around
it?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD The Galaxy

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



10 What is the biggest from the list below?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD A Planet

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds



10 What is the biggest from the list below?

AA The Universe

BB The Milky Way

CC The Solar System

DD A Planet

Time 
Remaining

15 Seconds 10 Seconds 5 Seconds




